
TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS May 16, 2016

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

Qualified Non-Qualified

1-16 8 0 135,380.95$         205,495.00$          

2-16 1 0 48,353.00$           54,258.75$            

3-16 7 0 93,701.20$           170,887.50$          

4-16 0 0 50,714.00$           

5-16 0 0 88,718.76$           

6-16 6 0 133,606.00$         159,290.00$          

7-16 6 0 9,458.80$             13,572.00$            

8-16 5 0 132,537.30$         181,651.00$          

9-16 4 0 32,310.00$           40,186.90$            

10-16 5 0 7,208.00$             9,476.00$              

*11-16 1 0 50,048.26$           62,091.90$            

12-16 5 0 179,736.00$         236,573.60$          

13-16 6 1 26,737.50$           36,340.00$            

14-16 1 1 23,153.30$           26,110.00$            

15-16 2 0 51,389.75$           81,521.00$            

16-16 2 0 13,870.50$           17,325.00$            

17-16 0 0 15,356.50$           

18-16 0 0 21,813.30$           

19-16 8 0 30,022.90$           57,096.50$            

20-16 0 0 46,417.00$           

21-16 3 0 10,773.00$           16,335.00$            

22-16 2 0 9,708.80$             14,541.00$            

*23-16 8 0 62,679.32$           90,844.00$            

*24-16 9 0 103,344.68$         152,247.50$          

25-16 6 0 21,320.00$           34,522.00$            

26-16 2 0 15,416.10$           24,260.00$            

*27-16 5 0 12,942.21$           19,269.00$            

28-16 3 0 39,029.25$           73,293.00$            

29-16 1 0 9,360.00$             12,525.00$            

31-16 4 0 70,480.00$           100,377.50$          

33-16 2 0 18,055.00$           27,940.00$            

Totals 112 2 1,563,641.38$      1,918,029.15$       

*lump sum

31 1,340,621.82$       

26 1,918,029.15$       

26 43%

5

114 26,037.00

112 1001

4.3 73.67$                   

1,638.00

63

1,170.96$              

Dairyland Forest Products

No Bid

Twin Forest Products LLC

Delaney Forest Products

Lambert Forest Products

Tigerton Lumber

Delaney Forest Products

Kron Logging

Tigerton Lumber

Burkey's Lumber LLC

Joe Weyer

Delaney Forest Products

TJ Raese & Company LLC

No Bid

Buffalo Lumber & Tie

Number of BidsTract 

Number

Average $ per Acre Sold 

Cord Equivalent Volume Sold

Dairyland Forest Products

No Bid

Tigerton Lumber

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids

Number of Tracts Offered

Total Number of Bids

No Bid

Russ Thums

Number of Tracts with No Bids

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids

Delaney Forest Products

Tlusty Logging Inc

Ule Logging

TJ Raese & Company LLC

Bid ValueHigh Bidder

Delaney Forest Products

Burkey's Lumber LLC

Appraised Value

Percent Increase Over Appraised Value

Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold

No Bid

Landwehr Custom Logging

Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract

Total Number of Qualifying Bids

June Bid Opening

Kafka Forestry

Average Acreage of Sold Tracts

Acres Sold

Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold

Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract

Martin's Forestry

Pilgrim Brothers Logging


























































